ADAMS COUNTY, COLORADO PURCHASE OF SERVICE AGREEMENT

The County and the Contractor, for the consideration herein set forth, agree as follows:

1. SERVICES OF THE CONTRACTOR:

- 1.1. All pricing shall be in accordance with the attached hereto as Exhibit A, and incorporated herein by reference. Should there be any discrepancy between Exhibit A and this Agreement the terms and conditions of this Agreement shall prevail.
- 1.2. Emergency Services: In the event the Adams County Board of County Commissioners declares an emergency, the County may request additional services (of the type described in this Agreement or otherwise within the expertise of the Contractor) to be performed by the Contractor. If the County requests such additional services, the Contractor shall provide such services in a timely fashion given the nature of the emergency, pursuant to the terms of this Agreement. Unless otherwise agreed to in writing by the parties, the Contractor shall bill for such services at the rates provided for in this Agreement.
- 2. <u>RESPONSIBILITIES OF THE COUNTY:</u> The County shall provide information as necessary or requested by the Contractor to enable the Contractor's performance under this Agreement.

3. <u>TERM:</u>

- 3.1. <u>Term of Agreement:</u> The Term of this Agreement shall be for one (1) year from the date of execution by Adams County Board of County Commissioners, unless sooner terminated as specified elsewhere herein.
- 4. <u>PAYMENT AND FEE SCHEDULE:</u> The County shall pay the Contractor for services furnished under this Agreement, and the Contractor shall accept as full payment for those services for the amounts attached in Exhibit A of the agreement not to exceed sixty thousand dollars and no cents (\$60,000.00).
 - 4.1. Payment pursuant to this Agreement, whether in full or in part, is subject to and contingent upon the continuing availability of County funds for the purposes hereof. In the event that funds become unavailable, as determined by the County, the County may immediately terminate this Agreement or amend it accordingly.
 - 4.2. Invoices will be submitted to the County by the Contractor on a per order basis for services performed under this agreement.

5. INDEPENDENT CONTRACTOR: In providing services under this Agreement, the Contractor acts as an independent contractor and not as an employee of the County. The Contractor shall be solely and entirely responsible for his/her acts and the acts of his/her employees, agents, servants, and subcontractors during the term and performance of this Agreement. No employee, agent, servant, or subcontractor of the Contractor shall be deemed to be an employee, agent, or servant of the County because of the performance of any services or work under this Agreement. The Contractor, at its expense, shall procure and maintain workers' compensation insurance as required by law. Pursuant to the Workers' Compensation Act § 8-40-202(2)(b)(IV), C.R.S., as amended, the Contractor understands that it and its employees and servants are not entitled to workers' compensation benefits from the County. The Contractor further understands that it is solely obligated for the payment of federal and state income tax on any moneys earned pursuant to this Agreement.

6. NONDISCRIMINATION:

- 6.1. The Contractor shall not discriminate against any employee or qualified applicant for employment because of age, race, color, religion, marital status, disability, sex, or national origin. The Contractor agrees to post in conspicuous places, available to employees and applicants for employment, notices provided by the local public agency setting forth the provisions of this nondiscrimination clause. Adams County is an equal opportunity employer.
 - 6.1.1. The Contractor will cause the foregoing provisions to be inserted in all subcontracts for any work covered by this Agreement so that such provisions will be binding upon each subcontractor, provided that the foregoing provisions shall not apply to contracts or subcontracts for standard commercial supplies or raw materials.
- 7. INDEMNIFICATION: The Contractor agrees to indemnify and hold harmless the County, its officers, agents, and employees for, from, and against any and all claims, suits, expenses, damages, or other liabilities, including reasonable attorney fees and court costs, arising out of damage or injury to persons, entities, or property, caused or sustained by any person(s) as a result of the Contractor's performance or failure to perform pursuant to the terms of this Agreement or as a result of any subcontractors' performance or failure to perform pursuant to the terms of this Agreement.
- **8.** <u>INSURANCE:</u> The Contractor agrees to maintain insurance of the following types and amounts:
 - 8.1. <u>Commercial General Liability Insurance:</u> to include products liability, completed operations, contractual, broad form property damage and personal injury.

8.1.1. Each Occurrence:

\$1,000,000

8.1.2. General Aggregate:

\$2,000,000

8.2. <u>Comprehensive Automobile Liability Insurance:</u> to include all motor vehicles owned, hired, leased, or borrowed.

8.2.1. Bodily Injury/Property Damage:

\$1,000,000 (each accident)

8.2.2. Personal Injury Protection:

Per Colorado Statutes

- 8.3. Workers' Compensation Insurance: Per Colorado Statutes
- 8.4. <u>Professional Liability Insurance</u>: to include coverage for damages or claims for damages arising out of the rendering, or failure to render, any professional services, as applicable. 8.4.1. Each Occurrence: \$1,000,000
 - 8.4.2. This insurance requirement applies only to the Contractors who are performing services under this Agreement as professionals licensed under the laws of the State of Colorado, such as physicians, lawyers, engineers, nurses, mental health providers, and any other licensed professionals.
- 8.5. Adams County as "Additional Insured": The Contractor's commercial general liability, comprehensive automobile liability, and professional liability insurance policies and/or certificates of insurance shall be issued to include Adams County as an "additional insured" and shall include the following provisions:
 - 8.5.1. Underwriters shall have no right of recovery or subrogation against the County, it being the intent of the parties that the insurance policies so affected shall protect both parties and be primary coverage for any and all losses resulting from the actions or negligence of the Contractor.
 - 8.5.2. The insurance companies issuing the policy or policies shall have no recourse against the County for payment of any premiums due or for any assessments under any form of any policy.
 - 8.5.3. Any and all deductibles contained in any insurance policy shall be assumed by and at the sole risk of the Contractor.
- 8.6. <u>Licensed Insurers:</u> All insurers of the Contractor must be licensed or approved to do business in the State of Colorado. Upon failure of the Contractor to furnish, deliver and/or maintain such insurance as provided herein, this Agreement, at the election of the County, may be immediately declared suspended, discontinued, or terminated. Failure of the Contractor in obtaining and/or maintaining any required insurance shall not relieve the Contractor from any liability under this Agreement, nor shall the insurance requirements be construed to conflict with the obligations of the Contractor concerning indemnification.
- 8.7. Endorsement: Each insurance policy herein required shall be endorsed to state that coverage shall not be suspended, voided, or canceled without thirty (30) days prior written notice by certified mail, return receipt requested, to the County.
- 8.8. <u>Proof of Insurance</u>: At any time during the term of this Agreement, the County may require the Contractor to provide proof of the insurance coverage or policies required under this Agreement.

9. TERMINATION:

9.1. For Cause: If, through any cause, the Contractor fails to fulfill its obligations under this Agreement in a timely and proper manner, or if the Contractor violates any of the covenants, conditions, or stipulations of this Agreement, the County shall thereupon have the right to immediately terminate this Agreement, upon giving written notice to the Contractor of such termination and specifying the effective date thereof.

9.2. For Convenience: The County may terminate this Agreement at any time by giving written notice as specified herein to the other party, which notice shall be given at least thirty (30) days prior to the effective date of the termination. If this Agreement is terminated by the County, the Contractor will be paid an amount that bears the same ratio to the total compensation as the services actually performed bear to the total services the Contractor was to perform under this Agreement, less payments previously made to the Contractor under this Agreement.

10. MUTUAL UNDERSTANDINGS:

- 10.1. <u>Jurisdiction and Venue:</u> The laws of the State of Colorado shall govern as to the interpretation, validity, and effect of this Agreement. The parties agree that jurisdiction and venue for any disputes arising under this Agreement shall be with Adams County, Colorado.
- 10.2. Compliance with Laws: During the performance of this Agreement, the Contractor agrees to strictly adhere to all applicable federal, state, and local laws, rules and regulations, including all licensing and permit requirements. The parties hereto aver that they are familiar with § 18-8-301, et seq., C.R.S. (Bribery and Corrupt Influences), as amended, and § 18-8-401, et seq., C.R.S. (Abuse of Public Office), as amended, and that no violation of such provisions are present. The Contractor warrants that it is in compliance with the residency requirements in §§ 8-17.5-101, et seq., C.R.S. Without limiting the generality of the foregoing, the Contractor expressly agrees to comply with the privacy and security requirements of the Health Insurance Portability and Accountability Act of 1996 (HIPAA).
- 10.3. OSHA: The Contractor shall comply with the requirements of the Occupational Safety and Health Act (OSHA) and shall review and comply with the County's safety regulations while on any County property. Failure to comply with any applicable federal, state or local law, rule, or regulation shall give the County the right to terminate this agreement for cause.
- 10.4. <u>Record Retention:</u> The Contractor shall maintain records and documentation of the services provided under this Agreement, including fiscal records, and shall retain the records for a period of three (3) years from the date this Agreement is terminated. Said records and documents shall be subject at all reasonable times to inspection, review, or audit by authorized Federal, State, or County personnel.
- 10.5. <u>Assign Ability:</u> Neither this Agreement, nor any rights hereunder, in whole or in part, shall be assignable or otherwise transferable by the Contractor without the prior written consent of the County.
- 10.6. <u>Waiver</u>: Waiver of strict performance or the breach of any provision of this Agreement shall not be deemed a waiver, nor shall it prejudice the waiving party's right to require strict performance of the same provision, or any other provision in the future, unless such waiver has rendered future performance commercially impossible.

- 10.7. <u>Force Majeure:</u> Neither party shall be liable for any delay or failure to perform its obligations hereunder to the extent that such delay or failure is caused by a force or event beyond the control of such party including, without limitation, war, embargoes, strikes, governmental restrictions, riots, fires, floods, earthquakes, or other acts of God.
- 10.8. Notice: Any notices given under this Agreement are deemed to have been received and to be effective: (1) Three (3) days after the same shall have been mailed by certified mail, return receipt requested; (2) Immediately upon hand delivery; or (3) Immediately upon receipt of confirmation that an E-mail was received. For the purposes of this Agreement, any and all notices shall be addressed to the contacts listed below:

Department: Adams County

Contact: Todd Leopold, County Manager Address: 4430 S Adams County Parkway City, State, Zip: Brighton, Colorado 80601

Phone: 720.523.6864

E-mail: tleopold@adcogov.org

Department: Adams County Purchasing

Contact: Bethany Bonasera, Purchasing Agent II Address: 4430 South Adams County Parkway City, State, Zip: Brighton, Colorado 80601

Phone: 720-523-6056

E-mail: bbonasera@adcogov.org

Department: Adams County Attorney's Office Address: 4430 South Adams County Parkway City, State, Zip: Brighton, Colorado 80601

Phone: 720-523-6116

Contractor: CopyCo Quality Printing

Contact: Farid

Address: 1507 Riverside Avenue

City, State, Zip: Fort Collins, Colorado 80524

Phone: 970-226-4179

E-mail: customerservice@copycoprint.com

- 10.9. <u>Integration of Understanding:</u> This Agreement contains the entire understanding of the parties hereto and neither it, nor the rights and obligations hereunder, may be changed, modified, or waived except by an instrument in writing that is signed by the parties hereto.
- 10.10. Severability: If any provision of this Agreement is determined to be unenforceable or invalid for any reason, the remainder of this Agreement shall remain in effect, unless otherwise terminated in accordance with the terms contained herein.

10.11. <u>Authorization:</u> Each party represents and warrants that it has the power and ability to enter into this Agreement, to grant the rights granted herein, and to perform the duties and obligations herein described.

11. CHANGE ORDERS OR EXTENSIONS:

- 11.1. Change Orders: The County may, from time to time, require changes in the scope of the services of the Contractor to be performed herein including, but not limited to, additional instructions, additional work, and the omission of work previously ordered. The Contractor shall be compensated for all authorized changes in services, pursuant to the applicable provision in the Invitation to Bid, or, if no provision exists, pursuant to the terms of the Change Order.
- 11.2. Extensions: The County may, upon mutual written agreement by the parties, extend the time of completion of services to be performed by the Contractor.
- 12. <u>COMPLIANCE WITH C.R.S. § 8-17.5-101, ET. SEQ. AS AMENDED 5/13/08:</u> Pursuant to Colorado Revised Statute (C.R.S.), § 8-17.5-101, *et. seq.*, as amended May 13, 2008, the Contractor shall meet the following requirements prior to signing this Agreement (public contract for service) and for the duration thereof:
 - 12.1. The Contractor shall certify participation in the E-Verify Program (the electronic employment verification program that is authorized in 8 U.S.C. § 1324a and jointly administered by the United States Department of Homeland Security and the Social Security Administration, or its successor program) or the Department Program (the employment verification program established by the Colorado Department of Labor and Employment pursuant to C.R.S. § 8-17.5-102(5)) on the attached certification.
 - 12.2. The Contractor shall not knowingly employ or contract with an illegal alien to perform work under this public contract for services.
 - 12.3. The Contractor shall not enter into a contract with a subcontractor that fails to certify to the Contractor that the subcontractor shall not knowingly employ or contract with an illegal alien to perform work under this public contract for services.
 - 12.4. At the time of signing this public contract for services, the Contractor has confirmed the employment eligibility of all employees who are newly hired for employment to perform work under this public contract for services through participation in either the E-Verify Program or the Department Program.
 - 12.5. The Contractor shall not use either the E-Verify Program or the Department Program procedures to undertake pre-employment screening of job applicants while this public contract for services is being performed.
 - 12.6. If the Contractor obtains actual knowledge that a subcontractor performing work under this public contract for services knowingly employs or contracts with an illegal alien, the Contractor shall: notify the subcontractor and the County within three (3) days that the Contractor has actual knowledge that the subcontractor is employing or contracting with an illegal alien; and terminate the subcontract with the subcontractor if within

three days of receiving the notice required pursuant to the previous paragraph, the subcontractor does not stop employing or contracting with the illegal alien; except that the Contractor shall not terminate the contract with the subcontractor if during such three (3) days the subcontractor provides information to establish that the subcontractor has not knowingly employed or contracted with an illegal alien.

- 12.7. Contractor shall comply with any reasonable requests by the Department of Labor and Employment (the Department) made in the course of an investigation that the Department is undertaking pursuant to the authority established in C.R.S. § 8-17.5-102(5).
- 12.8. If Contractor violates this Section, of this Agreement, the County may terminate this Agreement for breach of contract. If the Agreement is so terminated, the Contractor shall be liable for actual and consequential damages to the County.

The remainder of this page is left blank intentionally.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the Parties have caused their names to be affixed hereto:

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS ADAMS COUNTY, COLORADO	
Low Manager	Date 11/6/11
3,	
CONTRACTOR: COPYCO QUALITY PRINTING	
GOLNAR BARAZADEH	11/3/14
Name (Print or Type)	Date
EN BU	PRESIDENT
Authorized Signature	Title
ATTEST: Karen Long	APPROVED AS TO FORM:
Clerk and Recorder	Adams County Attorney's Office
m nf	By D. Cleby
	Attorney Signature
NOTARIZATION: COUNTY OF Landrey	7
)S	S.
STATE OF	of November 2014
20 m	, 2014,
by Bray and Landling Notary	Public
My commission expires on: $3 - 20 - 20$	TOTARY PUBLICATION
	BRYANT
	E. S.
	My Commission
	My Commission Expires 3/20/2016

CONTRACTOR'S CERTIFICATION OF COMPLIANCE

Pursuant to Colorado Revised Statute, § 8-17.5-101, et.seq., as amended 5/13/08, as a prerequisite to entering into a contract for services with Adams County, Colorado, the undersigned Contractor hereby certifies that at the time of this certification, Contractor does not knowingly employ or contract with an illegal alien who will perform work under the attached contract for services and that the Contractor will participate in the E-Verify Program or Department program, as those terms are defined in C.R.S. § 8-17.5-101, et. seq. in order to confirm the employment eligibility of all employees who are newly hired for employment to perform work under the attached contract for services.

CONTRACTOR:

COPYCO QUALITY PRINTING INC.	
Company Name	Date
GL BL	
Signature	
GOLNAR BABARADEH	
Name (Print or Type)	
PRESIDENT	
Title	

Note: Registration for the E-Verify Program can be completed at: https://www.vis-dhs.com/employerregistration. It is recommended that employers review the sample "memorandum of understanding" available at the website prior to registering

2013.124 RFP Printing of Business Cards, Letterhead, and Envelopes Bid Sheet

Stock provided by the Vendor must comply with the standards provided in the Adams County Graphics Standards Manual. Pricing is to include setup and delivery charges.

					-		
Quantíty/ Item	Adams County Letterhead (stock will be provided by the county)- See Example A	#10 Envelope for Adams County- See Example B	#10 Window Envelope- See Example C	10x13 Envelope- See Example D	Business Cards With Adams 1 sided- See County Logo Example E as printed on Example D	9x13 Envelope With Adams County Logo as printed on Example D	Labels for Adams County See Example F
250 Colored	\$35.36	\$70.91	\$70.91	\$135.06	\$15.07	\$104.45	\$131.35
250 Black	\$49.98	\$60.00	\$60.00	\$110.06	No Bid	\$105.00	\$116.55
500 Colored	\$39.36	\$72.91	\$72.91	\$159.98	\$16.35	\$157.09	\$218.30
500 Black	\$59.98	\$67.00	\$69.00	\$149.98	No Bid	\$139.98	\$203.50
1,000 Colored	\$53.45	\$76.70	\$76.70	\$232.75	\$17.64	\$228.03	\$276.57
1000 Black	\$63.98	\$96.48	\$6.66\$	\$199.95	No Bid	\$189.98	\$246.97
2500 Colored	\$95.72	\$88.08	\$88.08	\$491.97	No Bid	\$481.00	\$653.05
2500 Black	\$6.66\$	\$221.49	\$235.49	\$467.97	No Bid	\$457.00	\$638.25
5000 Colored	\$166.17	\$107.04	\$107.04	\$910.97	No Bid	\$815.00	\$1,131.27
	After Shell Price	After Shell Price	After Shell Price		After Shell Price		
Hourly Rate for Design Work:	\$25.00			•			
Shell for Adams County							
Letterhead							

\$25.00			
Hourly Rate for Design Work:	Shell for Adams County	Letterhead	

Business Card Shell		اسم	Letterhead Shell	79.	#10 Window / No Window Shells	Window Shells		
	50,000	\$975.16	50,000	\$1,500.00	10,000	\$862.40	000′09	\$4,679.08
	100,000	\$1,895.20	100,000	\$2,500.00	20,000	\$1,625.74	000'02	\$5,442.43
	150,000	\$2,598.00	150,000	\$3,000.00	30,000	\$2,389.07	80,000	\$6,205.76
	200,000	\$3,345.60	200,000	\$4,000.00	40,000	\$3,152.41	000'06	\$6,969.10
					50,000	\$3,915.75	100,000	\$7,732.43

\$15.00	
per 1,000	The second secon
Bindery (@ 1/2 standard rate)	

2013.124 RFP Printing of Business Cards, Letterhead, and Envelopes Bid Sheet DA OFFICE
Stock provided by the Vendor must comply with the standards provided in the Adams County Graphics Standards Mar

פוסכע הוסמומפת חל ווופ אפנונ	orch provided by the vendar most comply with the standards provided in the Adams County Graphics Standards Manual, Pricing is to include setup and delivery charges.	ards provided in the	Adams County Gra	phics Standards Ma	nual, Pricing is to ir	sclude setup and de	slivery charges.
~~~	DA Letterhood (stock	#10 E2370	#10 Window		10x13	C	*Business
Ouantity/ Item	will be provided by the	for DA Coo	Envelope For	Envelope For 6 x 9 Envelope Envelope-for	Envelope- for	Business	Cards- 1 sided-
	Collett/). See Evample @		DA-See	See Example J	DA- See	Cards- 1 sided	See Example
	councy) occ Evaluate O		Example i		Example K	See cxample c	Σ
250 Black Only	\$49.98	00.03\$	\$65.00	\$112.10	\$110.06	\$29.98	\$29.98
500 Black Only	\$59.98	\$67.00	\$69.00	\$140.63	\$149.98	\$34.95	\$34.95
1000 Black Only	\$6.9\$	\$96.48	\$99.89	\$161.94	\$199.98	\$49.98	\$41.98
2500 Black Only	\$95.98	\$221.49	\$235.49	\$341.19	\$467.97	No Bid	No Bid
5000 Black Only	\$179.98	\$429.84	\$445.84	\$718.93	\$838.98	No Bid	No Bid
			*yhotethrough			***************************************	

*DA Business Cards are printed in BLACK INK on 80lb Classic Laid Cover-Avon Brilliant White

2013.124 RFP Printing of Business Cards, Letterhead, and Envelopes Bid Sheet Sheriff Office

Stock provided by the Vendor must comply with the standards provided in the Adams County Graphics Standards Manual. Pricing is to include setup and delivery charges.

Quantity/ Item	Adams County Sheriff Letterhead (stock will be provided by the county)- See Example N	TT.	#10 Envelope Business For Adams Business County Sheriff Cards- 2 sided-See Example See Example P	Business Cards- 2 sided ³ See Example Q	Business Cards- 2 sided with foil (Adams County owns the foil)- See Example R
250 Colored	\$35.36	\$70.91	\$20.78	\$20.78	\$20.78
500 Colored	\$39.36	\$72.91	\$21.95	\$21.95	\$21.95
1,000 Colored	\$53.45	\$76.70	\$23.28	\$23.28	\$23.28
2500 Colored	\$95.72	\$88.08	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5000 Colored	\$166.17	\$107.04	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	After Shells	After Shells	After Shells	After Shelis	After Shells

	After Shells	After Shells	After Shells	After Shelfs	After SI
BC Foil Shells			BC Shells w/o Foil		
20,000	\$2,192.50		\$905.16		
100,000	\$3,970.00		\$1,825.20		
150,000	\$5,777.50		\$2,510.00		
200,000	\$7,525.00		\$3,275.60		

2013.124 RFP Printing of Business Cards, Letterhead, and Envelopes Bid Sheet HUMAN SERVICES

 Adams County Letterhead #10 Envelope for (stock will be provided by Adams County to county). See Example (Human Services A	#10 Envelope for Adams County Human Services See Example S	Color Striped Business Reply #10 Envelope for Adams County- Kurnan Services See Example 7	Business Reply #10 Envelope for Adams County-Muman Services See Example U	PINK Business Reply #10 Erwelope for Adams County-Human Services See Example V	Color Striped Susiness Reply #10 Envelope for Adems County- Humen Services See Example W	9 X 12 Envelope- See Example X	6 X 9 Envelope- See Example Y	6 X 9 Envelope N WITH WINDOW - See Example 2	6 X 9 Envelope with window for KITH WINDOWY - Adams County See Example 2 Human Services - See Example 2A	Grey 9 X 12 Envelope- See Example 28
\$35.36	No Sid	No 8id	No Sic	big cN	Pig cN	Più CN	No Bid	No bid	10 O O	70 -04
 \$49.98	\$61.00	\$75.00	\$51.00	\$89.72	\$75.00	\$172.76	67/7 88	\$66.00	CC2 C2	WD 500
\$39.36	No Bid	Pig oN	No Bid	No Sin	No Sid	No Rid	52 43	Nobid	150 AV	310 Did
\$59.98	\$67.00	\$82.00	\$57.00	\$104,52	587 09	\$150 QK	580 S2	CS CS CS	000 CM	010.5
\$53.45	No Bid	No Bid	No Bio	No Bid	No Rid	No Rid	Na Rid	No Bid	Sto Rid	2101 3U
\$59.98	\$96,48	\$111.48	\$96.48	\$149.85	\$121.48	\$247.62	\$17930	\$203 65	02 005	43E) ED
\$95.72	No Bid	\$444.84	No Sid	No Sic.	Pia CN	No Rich	No Rid	Se on	Tig Civ	2000
\$6.98	\$221.49	\$236.49	\$221.49	\$271.02	\$236.49	\$6.5.13	\$300.87	\$500.52	\$735.60	C807 GP
\$155.17	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bio	So Bid	No Rid	No Rid	No Rive	No Rid	2007
\$2.79.98	5429.84	\$464.84	\$429.84	\$512.45	\$4.000 RA	\$0.200	\$500 97	36 5173	20 20 CA	2000
Aber Chall						200	4.000.4	21.46.6	-0.0	74,727